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CITY OF CALGARY 
RECE~VED 

IN COUNCIL CHAMBER 

JUL 2 9 2019 
That Council: ITEM: . L/ C.,fs ,20('1 - c, 1,-Ss-
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1. Reaffirm its commitment to maintaining the 1.S1J;Afi11j-et¥% ... TMENT 

designated towards community-based projects that meet the criteria 
of the Prevention Investment Framework with Mental Health and 
Addiction Lens, noting that $3 million has been disbursed since 
October 2018; 

2. Authorize Administration to allocate up to $3 million of the previously 
earmarked funds for 2020, to maintain current programs funded 
through the Prevention Investment Framework with Mental Health 
and Addiction Lens that are demonstrating positive results; 

3. Receive the Community-based Action on Mental Health and 
Addiction Guiding Principles for information; 

4. Approve the revised terms of reference for the Community-based 
Action on Mental Health and Addiction Stewardship Group, and the 
terms of reference for the Community Investment table, to guide the 
development of the associated strategy; 

5. From the additional $10 million funding commitment that was made 
by Council in 2018 for programs arising from the Mental Health and 
Addiction Strategy, authorize Administration to allocate $1 million to 
take immediate action in testing promising initiatives through a fast 
pilot process that leverages private and philanthropic investment to 
address gaps and barriers, as deemed appropriate by the Mental 
Health and Addiction Stewardship Group; 

6. Direct that Administration report back no later than Q4 2020 with a 
Community Action on Mental Health and Addiction Strategy and 
collaborative implementation plan guided by the strategic framework 
(Attachment 1 to the June 12 report to the SPC on CPS); and 

7. Request that the Mayor and Chair of the SPC on Community and 
Protective Services continue to coordinate closely with Alberta's 
Associate Minister of Mental Health and Addictions, reporting back 
through the stewardship group on this collaborative partnership on a 
regular basis. 


